
 

 

 

Agenda 

 

 
 
Date: 
 

 
Friday, 20 November 2020 

 
Time: 
 

 
11.00 am 

 
Venue: 
 

 
virtual 

 
 Map and Directions  

  
The Briefing Meeting for Members will be held at 10am. There should 
be sufficient space in the car park at the Council Offices. 
 
http://www.aylesburyvaledc.gov.uk/finding-us 
 
Please note that this meeting may be webcast for subsequent 
broadcast. At the start of the meeting, the Chairman will confirm if all 
or part of the meeting is being filmed. You should be aware that the 
Council is a Data Controller under the Data Protection Act. Data 
collected during this recording will be retained in accordance with the 
Council’s published policy. 
 
Therefore by entering the room, you are consenting to being filmed 
and to the possible use of those images and sound recordings. If 
Members of the public do not wish to have their image captured they 
should highlight this to an Officer. If you have any queries regarding 
this, please contact the Scrutiny Officer on 07990368048 

 

 

1. Apologies for Absence  
 

2. Declarations of Interest  
 

3. Minutes (Pages 1 - 12) 
 

 To agree the Minutes of the meeting held on 4 September 2020. 
 

4. Public Question Time  
 

 Anyone who works or lives in the Thames Valley can ask a question 

http://www.aylesburyvaledc.gov.uk/finding-us


 

 

at meetings of the Police and Crime Panel, at which a 20 minute 
session will be designated for hearing from the public. 
 
If you’d like to participate, please read the Public Question Time 
Scheme and submit your questions by email to 
contact@thamesvalleypcp.org.uk at least three working days in 
advance of the meeting. 
 

5. Thames Valley Police - Estate Collaboration with 'Blue Light' 
emergency Services and Local Authorities (Pages 13 - 20) 

 

 The Panel to receive a presentation from Peter Smith (Strategy & 
Assets Manager, TVP Property Services). Report attached, together 
with background information paper, produced by the Panel’s Scrutiny 
Officer. 
 

6. Update on Road Safety Working Group (Pages 21 - 128) 
 

 To consider an attached report which updates the Panel on the work 
of the Road Safety Working Group which was set up as a result of a 
recommendation of this Panel in April 2017. 
 
Supt Colin Hudson from TVP will present the item. 
 

7. Police and Crime Plan Strategic Priority 2 - Performance Report - 
Prevention and Early Intervention (Pages 129 - 142) 

 

 To receive a report from the Police and Crime Commissioner.  
 

8. Professional & Ethical Standards Panel's Annual Assurance 
Report 2019 (Pages 143 - 150) 

 

 To consider the attached report. 
 

9. Report of the Complaints Sub-Committee (Pages 151 - 152) 
 

 To receive the attached report summarising recent complaints 
considered.    
 

10. Chairman and PCC Announcements and Topical Issues (Pages 
153 - 158) 

 

 To receive announcements from the PCC and the Chairman of the 
Panel and to note and ask questions on the topical issues report, 
produced by the Panel’s Scrutiny Officer. 
 

mailto:contact@thamesvalleypcp.org.uk


 

 

11. Work Programme (Pages 159 - 162) 
 

 For Panel Members to put forward items for the Work Programme 
including ideas for themed meetings. 
 

12. Exclusion of Press and Public  
 

 The public should be excluded during this item because its 
discussion in public would be likely to lead to the disclosure to 
members of the public present of information relating to the financial 
or business affairs of any particular person as detailed in paragraph 3 
of Part I of Schedule 12A to the Local Government Act 1972 (as 
amended): 
  
It is considered that in this case the public interest in maintaining the 
exemption outweighs the public interest in disclosing the information 
in that such disclosure would infringe the rights of the individual to 
privacy contrary to the general law and the duty of the authority to 
respect human rights and to comply with that law and contrary to the 
authority’s duties as a fair employer. 
 
 

 PART II 

13. Equip ERP Programme Update (Pages 163 - 166) 
 

 To receive a confidential report from the Police and Crime 
Commissioner. 
 

Date of next meeting: 29 January 2021 
 
Membership 
 
Chairman – Councillor Kieron Mallon 
Deputy Chairman - Councillor Bill Bendyshe-Brown 
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